
 
 Union 2020 Street 

Repairs Public Bid 
Opening May 26th, 
2020 at 5:30 pm 
Projects 

       CONTRACTOR 1 
  
Bluegrass 
     Contractor Bids 

      CONTRACTOR 2 
 Riegler 
    Contractor Bids 

       CONTRACTOR 
3 
Humphrey 
    Contractor Bids 

      CONTRACTOR 4 
 TMS 
    Contractor Bids 

CONTRACTOR 
5 
Michels 
    Contractor 
Bids 

PHASE A – 
RESURFACE or 
RECONST  (Parts 1 
thru 5)  

  

Phase A Part 1 (Full 
Recon) 
Sweet Harmony 
Lane  

50,088.74 41,445.00 No BID No BID 56,487.00 

Phase A Part 2 
(Resurface) 
Aspen Place (South)  

48,951.92 46,954.45 
 

No BID No BID 48,953.30 

Phase A Part 3 
(Resurface) 
Sumpter Court 

16,109.57 15,076.50 No BID No BID 16,070.00 

Phase A Part 4 
(Base/Surface/Pot 
Holes) 
16 Strs – About 
263.5 SY 

20,671.58 26,350.00 No BID No BID 29,967.50 

Phase A Part 5 
(Joints & Cracks 
Seal) – 3 Streets  
About 985 LF 

748.60 1390.00 No BID No BID 1,970.00 

TOTAL PUBLIC BID 
PHASE A PARTS 1, 2, 
3, 4 & 5 

136,570.41 131,215.95 No BID No BID 153,447.80 

   
PHASE B (CONCRETE 
CURB & GUTTER & 
SIDEWALK) – 
ABOUT 18 STREETS 

29  

TOTAL PUBLIC BID  
PHASE B 

32,275.99 34,120.00 24,676.00 31,815.00 39,891.00 

      
PHASE C 
(EDGE/SIDE 
DRAINS) 

  

Phase C Part 1 
(Braxton Drive) 
About 100 LF  

8310.00 7,635.00 No BID 9,000.00 No BID 



 
 

 

Phase C Part 2 (Mt 
Laurel Way) About 
410 LF 

27,730.00 29,405.00 No BID 25,900.00 No BID 

Phase C Part 3 
(Soaring Breezes) 
About 130 LF 

12,540.00 10,340.00 No BID 11,980.00 No BID 

Phase C Part 4 
(Wilshire Court) 
About 270 LF  

22,950.00 21,475.00 No BID 21,200.00 No BID 

TOTAL PUBLIC BID 
PHASE C – PARTS 1, 
2, 3 & 4 

71,530.00 68,855.00 No BID 68,080.00 No BID 

      
TOTAL PUBLIC BIDS  
PHASES A, B & C 

     

Surety/Performance 
Bond For City 
Attorney Review 

Yes ___x__ 
No _____ 

Yes _X____ 
No _____ 

Yes __X___ 
No _____ 

Yes __x___ 
No _____ 

Yes _X___ 
No _____ 

Contractor Ins. For 
Review by the 
Roeding Group 

Yes _x____ 
No _____ 

Yes ___  
No __X__ 

Yes ___X__ 
No _____ 

Yes __x___ 
No _____ 

Yes _____ 
No ___X__ 


